
GRACE COMMUNITY BIBLE FELLOWSHIP

THANKSGIVING AND WORSHIP SERVICE

August 18, 2019

9:30 a.m. Fellowship Breakfast
10:00 a.m Prayer for the Lost and the Persecuted
10:15 a.m. Worship in the Word 

Scripture Reading: Psalm 148
Scripture Reading: John 14:26-31

Songs of Praise, Worship and Thanksgiving

Glorious Day
We All Bow Down
What the Lord Has Done in Me
It Is Well

Sermon: The Holy Spirit Will Teach You

The Lord’s Supper

Prayer

If you have questions or comments about today’s sermon, please feel free to
contact me at 758-4400.

Jim Flaherty, pastor
       gracecbf.org

Scripture References

1 John 4:20 If someone says, “I love God,” and hates his brother,
he is a liar; for the one who does not love his brother whom he
has seen, cannot love God whom he has not seen. 

1 John 3:14 We know that we have passed out of death into life ,
because we love the brethren.

1 John 4:19 We love, because He first loved us.  

Romans 5:8 God demonstrates His own love toward us, in that
while we were yet sinners, Christ died for us. 

1 Corinthians 3:16 Do you not know that you are a temple of
God and that the Spirit of God dwells in you?

1 Corinthians 6:19 Or do you not know that your body is a
temple of the Holy Spirit who is in you, whom you have from
God, and that you are not your own? 20 For you have been
bought with a price: therefore glorify God in your body.

2 Corinthians 6:16 Or what agreement has the temple of God
with idols? For we are the temple of the living God; just as God
said, “I WILL DWELL IN THEM AND WALK AMONG THEM; AND I

WILL BE THEIR GOD, AND THEY SHALL BE MY PEOPLE.

Revelation 21:3 And I heard a loud voice from the throne,
saying, “Behold, the tabernacle of God is among men, and He
will dwell among them, and they shall be His people, and God
Himself will be among them,

Philippians 4:6 Be anxious for nothing, but in everything by
prayer and supplication with thanksgiving let your requests be
made known to God. 7 And the peace of God, which surpasses
all comprehension, will guard your hearts and your minds in



Christ Jesus.

Colossians 3:15 Let the peace of Christ rule in your hearts, to
which indeed you were called in one body; and be thankful. 16
Let the word of Christ richly dwell within you, with all wisdom
teaching and admonishing one another with psalms and hymns
and spiritual songs, singing with thankfulness in your hearts to
God. 

Hebrews 9:11 But when Christ appeared as a high priest of the
good things to come, He entered through the greater and more
perfect tabernacle, not made with hands, that is to say, not of this
creation; 12 and not through the blood of goats and calves, but
through His own blood, He entered the holy place once for all,
having obtained eternal redemption. 13 For if the blood of goats
and bulls and the ashes of a heifer sprinkling those who have
been defiled sanctify for the cleansing of the flesh, 14 how much
more will the blood of Christ, who through the eternal Spirit
offered Himself without blemish to God, cleanse your
conscience from dead works to serve the living God?

Philippians 2:3 Do nothing from selfishness or empty conceit,
but with humility of mind regard one another as more important
than yourselves; 4 do not merely look out for your own personal
interests, but also for the interests of others. 5 Have this attitude
in yourselves which was also in Christ Jesus, 6 who, although
He existed in the form of God, did not regard equality with God
a thing to be grasped, 7 but emptied Himself, taking the form of
a bond-servant, and being made in the likeness of men. 8 Being
found in appearance as a man, He humbled Himself by
becoming obedient to the point of death, even death on a cross. 9
For this reason also, God highly exalted Him, and bestowed on
Him the name which is above every name, 10 so that at the name
of Jesus EVERY KNEE WILL BOW, of those who are in
heaven and on earth and under the earth, 11 and that every
tongue will confess that Jesus Christ is Lord, to the glory of God

the Father.

2 Corinthians 8:9 For you know the grace of our Lord Jesus
Christ, that though He was rich, yet for your sake He became
poor, so that you through His poverty might become rich.

1 John 3:7 Little children, make sure no one deceives you; the
one who practices righteousness is righteous, just as He is
righteous; 8 the one who practices sin is of the devil; for the
devil has sinned from the beginning. The Son of God appeared
for this purpose, to destroy the works of the devil.

Hebrews 2:14 Therefore, since the children share in flesh and
blood, He Himself likewise also partook of the same, that
through death He might render powerless him who had the
power of death, that is, the devil, 15 and might free those who
through fear of death were subject to slavery all their lives. 

Revelation 20:10 And the devil who deceived them was thrown
into the lake of fire and brimstone, where the beast and the false
prophet are also; and they will be tormented day and night
forever and ever.

Acts 2:23 this Man, delivered over by the predetermined plan
and foreknowledge of God, you nailed to a cross by the hands of
godless men and put Him to death. 24 But God raised Him up
again, putting an end to the agony of death, since it was
impossible for Him to be held in its power.

Acts 4:27 For truly in this city there were gathered together
against Your holy servant Jesus, whom You anointed, both
Herod and Pontius Pilate, along with the Gentiles and the
peoples of Israel, 28 to do whatever Your hand and Your
purpose predestined to occur.


